

WARREN CONSOLIDATED SCHOOLS
Asbestos Abatement Bid Tabulation

February 14, 2024

CONTRACTOR	ADDENDUM 1	BID BOND	FAMILIAL DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	IRAN DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	BID 1 GREEN ACRES HARWOOD ES PEARL LEAN ES	BID 2 STERSMA ES	BID 3 BEER MS	BID 4 MOTT HS
QUALIFIED ABATEMENT SERVICES	✓	✓	✓	✓	\$9,800.00	\$185,000.00	\$198,800.00	\$369,000.00
ENVIRONMENTAL MAINTENANCE ENGINEERS	✓	✓	✓	✓	\$9,520.00	\$173,500.00	\$168,500.00	\$310,600.00
TOTAL ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES	-	-	-	-	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
TRUST THERMAL ABATEMENT	✓	✓	✓	✓	NO BID	\$210,000.00	\$315,000.00	\$420,000.00
BDS ENVIRONMENTAL	✓	✓	✓	✓	\$8,900.00	\$139,800.00	\$207,000.00	\$289,000.00
GLOBAL GREEN SERVICE GROUP	✓	✓	✓	✓	\$17,500.00	\$178,000.00	\$238,300.00	\$332,400.00
QUALITY ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES	-	-	-	-	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
BREATHE FREE DUCT CLEANING	-	-	-	-	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
PRIME CONTRACTING, LLC	-	-	-	-	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID